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Welcome to E-XFL.COM

What is "Embedded - Microcontrollers"?

"Embedded - Microcontrollers" refer to small, integrated
circuits designed to perform specific tasks within larger
systems. These microcontrollers are essentially compact
computers on a single chip, containing a processor core,
memory, and programmable input/output peripherals.
They are called "embedded" because they are embedded
within electronic devices to control various functions,
rather than serving as standalone computers.
Microcontrollers are crucial in modern electronics,
providing the intelligence and control needed for a wide
range of applications.

Applications of "Embedded -
Microcontrollers"

Embedded microcontrollers are used in virtually every
sector of electronics, providing the necessary control and
processing power for a multitude of applications. In
consumer electronics, they manage the operations of
smartphones, home appliances, and wearable devices. In
automotive systems, microcontrollers control engine
functions, safety features, and infotainment systems.
Industrial applications rely on microcontrollers for
automation, robotics, and process control. Additionally,
microcontrollers are integral in medical devices, handling
functions such as monitoring, diagnostics, and control of
therapeutic equipment. Their versatility and
programmability make them essential components in
creating efficient, responsive, and intelligent electronic
systems.

Common Subcategories of "Embedded -
Microcontrollers"

Embedded microcontrollers can be categorized based on
their architecture, performance, and application focus.
Common subcategories include 8-bit, 16-bit, and 32-bit
microcontrollers, differentiated by their processing power
and memory capacity. 8-bit microcontrollers are typically
used in simple applications like basic control systems and
small devices. 16-bit microcontrollers offer a balance
between performance and complexity, suitable for
medium-scale applications like industrial automation. 32-
bit microcontrollers provide high performance and are
used in complex applications requiring advanced
processing, such as automotive systems and sophisticated
consumer electronics. Each subcategory serves a specific
range of applications, providing tailored solutions for
different performance and complexity needs.

Types of "Embedded - Microcontrollers"

There are various types of embedded microcontrollers,
each designed to meet specific application requirements.
General-purpose microcontrollers are versatile and used in
a wide range of applications, offering a balance of
performance, memory, and peripheral options. Special-
purpose microcontrollers are tailored for specific tasks,
such as automotive controllers, which include features like
built-in motor control peripherals and automotive-grade
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PIC16C5X
Pin Diagrams

Device Differences

Note 1: If you change from this device to another device, please verify oscillator characteristics in your application.

Device
Voltage
 Range

Oscillator
Selection
(Program)

Oscillator
Process

Technology
(Microns)

ROM
Equivalent

MCLR
Filter

PIC16C54 2.5-6.25 Factory See Note 1 1.2 PIC16CR54A No

PIC16C54A 2.0-6.25 User See Note 1 0.9 — No

PIC16C54C 2.5-5.5 User See Note 1 0.7 PIC16CR54C Yes

PIC16C55 2.5-6.25 Factory See Note 1 1.7 — No

PIC16C55A 2.5-5.5 User See Note 1 0.7 — Yes

PIC16C56 2.5-6.25 Factory See Note 1 1.7 — No

PIC16C56A 2.5-5.5 User See Note 1 0.7 PIC16CR56A Yes

PIC16C57 2.5-6.25 Factory See Note 1 1.2 — No

PIC16C57C 2.5-5.5 User See Note 1 0.7 PIC16CR57C Yes

PIC16C58B 2.5-5.5 User See Note 1 0.7 PIC16CR58B Yes

PIC16CR54A 2.5-6.25 Factory See Note 1 1.2 N/A Yes

PIC16CR54C 2.5-5.5 Factory See Note 1 0.7 N/A Yes

PIC16CR56A 2.5-5.5 Factory See Note 1 0.7 N/A Yes

PIC16CR57C 2.5-5.5 Factory See Note 1 0.7 N/A Yes

PIC16CR58B 2.5-5.5 Factory See Note 1 0.7 N/A Yes

PDIP, SOIC, Windowed CERDIP

P
IC

1
6

C
R

5
4

P
IC

1
6

C
5

8
P

IC
1

6
C

R
5

8

P
IC

1
6

C
5

4

RA1
RA0
OSC1/CLKIN
OSC2/CLKOUT
VDD

VDD

RB7
RB6
RB5
RB4

RA2
RA3

T0CKI
MCLR/VPP

VSS

VSS

RB0
RB1
RB2
RB3

1
2
3
4
5
6
7
8
9
10

20
19
18
17
16
15
14
13
12
11

SSOP

P
IC

1
6

C
5

6
P

IC
1

6
C

R
5

6

P
IC

1
6

C
R

5
4

P
IC

1
6

C
5

8
P

IC
1

6
C

R
5

8

P
IC

1
6

C
5

4

P
IC

1
6

C
5

6
P

IC
1

6
C

R
5

6

RA2
RA3

T0CKI
MCLR/VPP

VSS

RB0

RB1
RB2
RB3

1
2
3
4

5
6

7
8

9 10

18
17
16

15
14

13
12

11

RA1
RA0
OSC1/CLKIN
OSC2/CLKOUT
VDD

RB7
RB6

RB5
RB4

28

27

26

25

24

23

22

21

20

19

18

17

16

15

•1

2

3

4

5

6

7

8

9

10

11

12

13

14

PDIP, SOIC, Windowed CERDIP

P
IC

1
6

C
5

7
P

IC
1

6
C

5
5

MCLR/VPP

OSC1/CLKIN
OSC2/CLKOUT
RC7
RC6
RC5
RC4
RC3
RC2
RC1
RC0
RB7
RB6
RB5

T0CKI
VDD

VSS

RA0
RA1
RA2
RA3
RB0
RB1
RB2
RB3
RB4

1
2
3
4
5
6
7
8
9
10
11
12
13
14

28
27
26
25
24
23
22
21
20
19
18
17
16
15

SSOP

P
IC

1
6

C
5

5

VDD

VSS

P
IC

1
6

C
R

5
7

P
IC

1
6

C
R

5
7

T0CKI

VDD

N/C

VSS

N/C

RA0

RA1

RA2

RA3

RB0

RB1

RB2

RB3

RB4

MCLR/VPP

OSC1/CLKIN

OSC2/CLKOUT

RC7

RC6

RC5
RC4

RC3

RC2

RC1

RC0

RB7

RB6

RB5

P
IC

1
6

C
5

7

Note: The table shown above shows the generic names of the PIC16C5X devices. For device varieties, please
refer to Section 2.0.
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NOTES:
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PIC16C5X
8-Bit EPROM/ROM-Based CMOS Microcontrollers
1.0 GENERAL DESCRIPTION

The PIC16C5X from Microchip Technology is a family
of low cost, high performance, 8-bit fully static,
EPROM/ROM-based CMOS microcontrollers. It
employs a RISC architecture with only 33 single word/
single cycle instructions. All instructions are single
cycle except for program branches which take two
cycles. The PIC16C5X delivers performance in an
order of magnitude higher than its competitors in the
same price category. The 12-bit wide instructions are
highly symmetrical resulting in 2:1 code compression
over other 8-bit microcontrollers in its class. The easy
to use and easy to remember instruction set reduces
development time significantly.

The PIC16C5X products are equipped with special fea-
tures that reduce system cost and power requirements.
The Power-on Reset (POR) and Device Reset Timer
(DRT) eliminate the need for external RESET circuitry.
There are four oscillator configurations to choose from,
including the power saving LP (Low Power) oscillator
and cost saving RC oscillator. Power saving SLEEP
mode, Watchdog Timer and Code Protection features
improve system cost, power and reliability.

The UV erasable CERDIP packaged versions are ideal
for code development, while the cost effective One
Time Programmable (OTP) versions are suitable for
production in any volume. The customer can take full
advantage of Microchip’s price leadership in OTP
microcontrollers, while benefiting from the OTP’s
flexibility.

The PIC16C5X products are supported by a full fea-
tured macro assembler, a software simulator, an in-cir-
cuit emulator, a low cost development programmer and
a full featured programmer. All the tools are supported
on IBM PC and compatible machines.

1.1 Applications

The PIC16C5X series fits perfectly in applications rang-
ing from high speed automotive and appliance motor
control to low power remote transmitters/receivers,
pointing devices and telecom processors. The EPROM
technology makes customizing application programs
(transmitter codes, motor speeds, receiver frequen-
cies, etc.) extremely fast and convenient. The small
footprint packages, for through hole or surface mount-
ing, make this microcontroller series perfect for applica-
tions with space limitations. Low cost, low power, high
performance ease of use and I/O flexibility make the
PIC16C5X series very versatile even in areas where no
microcontroller use has been considered before (e.g.,
timer functions, replacement of “glue” logic in larger
systems, co-processor applications).
 1997-2013 Microchip Technology Inc. Preliminary DS30453E-page 5



PIC16C5X
TABLE 1-1: PIC16C5X FAMILY OF DEVICES

Features PIC16C54 PIC16CR54 PIC16C55 PIC16C56 PIC16CR56

Maximum Operation Frequency 40 MHz 20 MHz 40 MHz 40 MHz 20 MHz

EPROM Program Memory (x12 words) 512 — 512 1K —

ROM Program Memory (x12 words) — 512 — — 1K

RAM Data Memory (bytes) 25 25 24 25 25

Timer Module(s) TMR0 TMR0 TMR0 TMR0 TMR0

I/O Pins 12 12 20 12 12

Number of Instructions 33 33 33 33 33

Packages 18-pin DIP,
SOIC; 

20-pin SSOP

18-pin DIP,
SOIC; 

20-pin SSOP

28-pin DIP, 
SOIC; 

28-pin SSOP

18-pin DIP, 
SOIC; 

20-pin SSOP

18-pin DIP, 
SOIC; 

20-pin SSOP

All PIC® Family devices have Power-on Reset, selectable Watchdog Timer, selectable Code Protect and high 
I/O current capability.

Features PIC16C57 PIC16CR57 PIC16C58 PIC16CR58

Maximum Operation Frequency 40 MHz 20 MHz 40 MHz 20 MHz

EPROM Program Memory (x12 words) 2K — 2K —

ROM Program Memory (x12 words) — 2K — 2K

RAM Data Memory (bytes) 72 72 73 73

Timer Module(s) TMR0 TMR0 TMR0 TMR0

I/O Pins 20 20 12 12

Number of Instructions 33 33 33 33

Packages 28-pin DIP, SOIC; 
28-pin SSOP

28-pin DIP, SOIC; 
28-pin SSOP

18-pin DIP, SOIC; 
20-pin SSOP

18-pin DIP, SOIC; 
20-pin SSOP

All PIC® Family devices have Power-on Reset, selectable Watchdog Timer, selectable Code Protect and high 
I/O current capability.
DS30453E-page 6 Preliminary  1997-2013 Microchip Technology Inc.



PIC16C5X
3.1 Clocking Scheme/Instruction 
Cycle

The clock input (OSC1/CLKIN pin) is internally divided
by four to generate four non-overlapping quadrature
clocks, namely Q1, Q2, Q3 and Q4. Internally, the pro-
gram counter is incremented every Q1 and the instruc-
tion is fetched from program memory and latched into
the instruction register in Q4. It is decoded and exe-
cuted during the following Q1 through Q4. The clocks
and instruction execution flow are shown in Figure 3-2
and Example 3-1.

3.2 Instruction Flow/Pipelining

An Instruction Cycle consists of four Q cycles (Q1, Q2,
Q3 and Q4). The instruction fetch and execute are
pipelined such that fetch takes one instruction cycle,
while decode and execute takes another instruction
cycle. However, due to the pipelining, each instruction
effectively executes in one cycle. If an instruction
causes the program counter to change (e.g., GOTO),
then two cycles are required to complete the instruction
(Example 3-1).

A fetch cycle begins with the program counter (PC)
incrementing in Q1.

In the execution cycle, the fetched instruction is latched
into the Instruction Register in cycle Q1. This instruc-
tion is then decoded and executed during the Q2, Q3
and Q4 cycles. Data memory is read during Q2 (oper-
and read) and written during Q4 (destination write).

FIGURE 3-2: CLOCK/INSTRUCTION CYCLE

EXAMPLE 3-1: INSTRUCTION PIPELINE FLOW

Q1 Q2 Q3 Q4 Q1 Q2 Q3 Q4 Q1 Q2 Q3 Q4

OSC1

Q1

Q2

Q3

Q4

PC

OSC2/CLKOUT
(RC mode)

PC PC+1 PC+2

Fetch INST (PC)
Execute INST (PC-1) Fetch INST (PC+1)

Execute INST (PC) Fetch INST (PC+2)
Execute INST (PC+1)

Internal
phase
clock

All instructions are single cycle, except for any program branches. These take two cycles since the fetch instruction
is “flushed” from the pipeline, while the new instruction is being fetched and then executed. 

1. MOVLW H'55' Fetch 1 Execute 1

2. MOVWF PORTB Fetch 2 Execute 2

3. CALL  SUB_1 Fetch 3 Execute 3

4. BSF   PORTA, BIT3 Fetch 4 Flush

Fetch SUB_1 Execute SUB_1
 1997-2013 Microchip Technology Inc. Preliminary DS30453E-page 13



PIC16C5X
5.0 RESET

PIC16C5X devices may be RESET in one of the follow-
ing ways:

• Power-On Reset (POR) 

• MCLR Reset (normal operation)

• MCLR Wake-up Reset (from SLEEP)

• WDT Reset (normal operation)

• WDT Wake-up Reset (from SLEEP)

Table 5-1 shows these RESET conditions for the PCL
and STATUS registers.

Some registers are not affected in any RESET condi-
tion. Their status is unknown on POR and unchanged
in any other RESET. Most other registers are reset to a
“RESET state” on Power-On Reset (POR), MCLR or
WDT Reset. A MCLR or WDT wake-up from SLEEP
also results in a device RESET, and not a continuation
of operation before SLEEP.

The TO and PD bits (STATUS <4:3>) are set or cleared
depending on the different RESET conditions (Table 5-
1). These bits may be used to determine the nature of
the RESET.

Table 5-3 lists a full description of RESET states of all
registers. Figure 5-1 shows a simplified block diagram
of the On-chip Reset circuit.

TABLE 5-1: STATUS BITS AND THEIR SIGNIFICANCE 

TABLE 5-2: SUMMARY OF REGISTERS ASSOCIATED WITH RESET

Condition TO PD

Power-On Reset 1 1

MCLR Reset (normal operation) u u

MCLR Wake-up (from SLEEP) 1 0

WDT Reset (normal operation) 0 1

WDT Wake-up (from SLEEP) 0 0

Legend: u = unchanged, x = unknown, — = unimplemented read as '0'.

Address Name Bit 7 Bit 6 Bit 5 Bit 4 Bit 3 Bit 2 Bit 1 Bit 0
Value on 

POR

Value on 
MCLR and 
WDT Reset

03h STATUS PA2 PA1 PA0 TO PD Z DC C 0001 1xxx 000q quuu

Legend: u = unchanged, x = unknown, q = see Table 5-1 for possible values.
 1997-2013 Microchip Technology Inc. Preliminary DS30453E-page 19



PIC16C5X
REGISTER 9-2: CONFIGURATION WORD FOR PIC16C54/C55/C56/C57       

— — — — — — — — CP WDTE FOSC1 FOSC0

bit 11 bit 0

bit 11-4: Unimplemented: Read as ‘0’

bit 3: CP: Code protection bit.
1 = Code protection off
0 = Code protection on

bit 2: WDTE: Watchdog timer enable bit 

1 = WDT enabled
0 = WDT disabled

bit 1-0: FOSC1:FOSC0: Oscillator selection bits(2)

00 = LP oscillator
01 = XT oscillator
10 = HS oscillator
11 = RC oscillator

Note 1: Refer to the PIC16C5X Programming Specifications (Literature Number DS30190) to determine how to 
access the configuration word.

2: PIC16LV54A supports XT, RC and LP oscillator only.

Legend:

R = Readable bit W = Writable bit U = Unimplemented bit, read as ‘0’

-n = Value at POR 1 = bit is set 0 = bit is cleared x = bit is unknown
 1997-2013 Microchip Technology Inc. Preliminary DS30453E-page 45



PIC16C5X
9.2 Watchdog Timer (WDT)

The Watchdog Timer (WDT) is a free running on-chip
RC oscillator which does not require any external com-
ponents. This RC oscillator is separate from the RC
oscillator of the OSC1/CLKIN pin. That means that the
WDT will run even if the clock on the OSC1/CLKIN and
OSC2/CLKOUT pins have been stopped, for example,
by execution of a SLEEP instruction. During normal
operation or SLEEP, a WDT Reset or Wake-up Reset
generates a device RESET. 

The TO bit (STATUS<4>) will be cleared upon a Watch-
dog Timer Reset (Section 6.3).

The WDT can be permanently disabled by program-
ming the configuration bit WDTE as a '0' (Section 9.1).
Refer to the PIC16C5X Programming Specifications
(Literature Number DS30190) to determine how to
access the configuration word.

9.2.1 WDT PERIOD

An 8-bit counter is available as a prescaler for the
Timer0 module (Section 8.2), or as a postscaler for the
Watchdog Timer (WDT), respectively. For simplicity,
this counter is being referred to as “prescaler” through-
out this data sheet. Note that the prescaler may be
used by either the Timer0 module or the WDT, but not

both. Thus, a prescaler assignment for the Timer0
module means that there is no prescaler for the WDT,
and vice-versa.

The PSA and PS<2:0> bits (OPTION<3:0>) determine
prescaler assignment and prescale ratio (Section 6.4).

The WDT has a nominal time-out period of 18 ms (with
no prescaler). If a longer time-out period is desired, a
prescaler with a division ratio of up to 1:128 can be
assigned to the WDT (under software control) by writ-
ing to the OPTION register. Thus, time-out a period of
a nominal 2.3 seconds can be realized. These periods
vary with temperature, VDD and part-to-part process
variations (see Device Characterization).

Under worst case conditions (VDD = Min., Temperature
= Max., WDT prescaler = 1:128), it may take several
seconds before a WDT time-out occurs.

9.2.2 WDT PROGRAMMING 
CONSIDERATIONS

The CLRWDT instruction clears the WDT and the pres-
caler, if assigned to the WDT, and prevents it from tim-
ing out and generating a device RESET. 

The SLEEP instruction RESETS the WDT and the pres-
caler, if assigned to the WDT. This gives the maximum
SLEEP time before a WDT Wake-up Reset. 

FIGURE 9-1: WATCHDOG TIMER BLOCK DIAGRAM 

TABLE 9-1: SUMMARY OF REGISTERS ASSOCIATED WITH THE WATCHDOG TIMER

Address Name Bit 7 Bit 6 Bit 5 Bit 4 Bit 3 Bit 2 Bit 1 Bit 0
Value on 

Power-On 
Reset

Value on 
MCLR and 
WDT Reset

N/A OPTION — — Tosc Tose PSA PS2 PS1 PS0 --11 1111 --11 1111

Legend: u = unchanged, - = unimplemented, read as '0'. Shaded cells not used by Watchdog Timer.

10

1

0

From TMR0 Clock Source

To TMR0

WDT Enable

EPROM Bit

PSA

WDT 

Time-out

PS2:PS0

PSAMUX

8 - to - 1 MUX

M

U

X

Watchdog

Timer

Note: T0CS, T0SE, PSA, PS2:PS0 are bits in the
OPTION register.

Prescaler
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PIC16C5X
11.8 MPLAB ICD In-Circuit Debugger

Microchip's In-Circuit Debugger, MPLAB ICD, is a pow-
erful, low cost, run-time development tool. This tool is
based on the FLASH PIC MCUs and can be used to
develop for this and other PIC microcontrollers. The
MPLAB ICD utilizes the in-circuit debugging capability
built into the FLASH devices. This feature, along with
Microchip's In-Circuit Serial ProgrammingTM protocol,
offers cost-effective in-circuit FLASH debugging from
the graphical user interface of the MPLAB Integrated
Development Environment. This enables a designer to
develop and debug source code by watching variables,
single-stepping and setting break points. Running at
full speed enables testing hardware in real-time.

11.9 PRO MATE II Universal Device 
Programmer

The PRO MATE II universal device programmer is a
full-featured programmer, capable of operating in
Stand-alone mode, as well as PC-hosted mode. The
PRO MATE II device programmer is CE compliant.

The PRO MATE II device programmer has program-
mable VDD and VPP supplies, which allow it to verify
programmed memory at VDD min and VDD max for max-
imum reliability. It has an LCD display for instructions
and error messages, keys to enter commands and a
modular detachable socket assembly to support various
package types. In Stand-alone mode, the PRO MATE II
device programmer can read, verify, or program PIC
devices. It can also set code protection in this mode.

11.10 PICSTART Plus Entry Level 
Development Programmer

The PICSTART Plus development programmer is an
easy-to-use, low cost, prototype programmer. It con-
nects to the PC via a COM (RS-232) port. MPLAB
Integrated Development Environment software makes
using the programmer simple and efficient.

The PICSTART Plus development programmer sup-
ports all PIC devices with up to 40 pins. Larger pin
count devices, such as the PIC16C92X and
PIC17C76X, may be supported with an adapter socket.
The PICSTART Plus development programmer is CE
compliant.

11.11 PICDEM 1 Low Cost PIC MCU
Demonstration Board

The PICDEM 1 demonstration board is a simple board
which demonstrates the capabilities of several of
Microchip’s microcontrollers. The microcontrollers sup-
ported are: PIC16C5X (PIC16C54 to PIC16C58A),
PIC16C61, PIC16C62X, PIC16C71, PIC16C8X,
PIC17C42, PIC17C43 and PIC17C44. All necessary
hardware and software is included to run basic demo
programs. The user can program the sample microcon-
trollers provided with the PICDEM 1 demonstration
board on a PRO MATE II device programmer, or a
PICSTART Plus development programmer, and easily
test firmware. The user can also connect the
PICDEM 1 demonstration board to the MPLAB ICE in-
circuit emulator and download the firmware to the emu-
lator for testing. A prototype area is available for the
user to build some additional hardware and connect it
to the microcontroller socket(s). Some of the features
include an RS-232 interface, a potentiometer for simu-
lated analog input, push button switches and eight
LEDs connected to PORTB.

11.12 PICDEM 2 Low Cost PIC16CXX 
Demonstration Board

The PICDEM 2 demonstration board is a simple dem-
onstration board that supports the PIC16C62,
PIC16C64, PIC16C65, PIC16C73 and PIC16C74
microcontrollers. All the necessary hardware and soft-
ware is included to run the basic demonstration pro-
grams. The user can program the sample
microcontrollers provided with the PICDEM 2 demon-
stration board on a PRO MATE II device programmer,
or a PICSTART Plus development programmer, and
easily test firmware. The MPLAB ICE in-circuit emula-
tor may also be used with the PICDEM 2 demonstration
board to test firmware. A prototype area has been pro-
vided to the user for adding additional hardware and
connecting it to the microcontroller socket(s). Some of
the features include a RS-232 interface, push button
switches, a potentiometer for simulated analog input, a
serial EEPROM to demonstrate usage of the I2CTM bus
and separate headers for connection to an LCD
module and a keypad.
 1997-2013 Microchip Technology Inc. Preliminary DS30453E-page 63



PIC16C5X
TABLE 11-1: DEVELOPMENT TOOLS FROM MICROCHIP
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PIC16C5X
FIGURE 12-4: RESET, WATCHDOG TIMER, AND DEVICE RESET TIMER TIMING - 
PIC16C54/55/56/57

TABLE 12-3: RESET, WATCHDOG TIMER, AND DEVICE RESET TIMER - PIC16C54/55/56/57 

AC Characteristics

Standard Operating Conditions (unless otherwise specified)
Operating Temperature 0°C  TA  +70°C for commercial

–40°C  TA  +85°C for industrial
–40°C  TA  +125°C for extended

Param
No. Symbol Characteristic Min Typ† Max Units Conditions

30 TmcL MCLR Pulse Width (low) 100* — — ns VDD = 5.0V

31 Twdt Watchdog Timer Time-out Period 
(No Prescaler) 

9.0* 18* 30* ms VDD = 5.0V (Comm)

32 TDRT Device Reset Timer Period 9.0* 18* 30* ms VDD = 5.0V (Comm)

34 TioZ I/O Hi-impedance from MCLR Low — — 100* ns

* These parameters are characterized but not tested.

† Data in the Typical (“Typ”) column is at 5.0V, 25°C unless otherwise stated. These parameters are for design
guidance only and are not tested.

VDD

MCLR

Internal
POR

DRT
Time-out

Internal
RESET

Watchdog
Timer
Reset

32

31

34

I/O pin

32 32

34

(Note 1)

30

Note 1: Please refer to Figure 12-1 for load conditions.
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PIC16C5X
FIGURE 13-3: CLKOUT AND I/O TIMING - PIC16CR54A 

TABLE 13-2: CLKOUT AND I/O TIMING REQUIREMENTS - PIC16CR54A 

AC Characteristics

Standard Operating Conditions (unless otherwise specified)
Operating Temperature 0°C  TA  +70C for commercial

–40C  TA  +85C for industrial
–40C  TA  +125C for extended

Param 
No.

Symbol Characteristic Min Typ† Max Units

10 TosH2ckL OSC1 to CLKOUT(1) — 15 30** ns

11 TosH2ckH OSC1 to CLKOUT(1) — 15 30** ns

12 TckR CLKOUT rise time(1) — 5.0 15** ns

13 TckF CLKOUT fall time(1) — 5.0 15** ns

14 TckL2ioV CLKOUT to Port out valid(1) — — 40** ns

15 TioV2ckH Port in valid before CLKOUT(1) 0.25 TCY+30* — — ns 

16 TckH2ioI Port in hold after CLKOUT(1) 0* — — ns

17 TosH2ioV OSC1 (Q1 cycle) to Port out valid(2) — — 100* ns

18 TosH2ioI OSC1 (Q2 cycle) to Port input invalid
(I/O in hold time)

TBD — — ns

19 TioV2osH Port input valid to OSC1
(I/O in setup time)

TBD — — ns

20 TioR Port output rise time(2) — 10 25** ns

21 TioF Port output fall time(2) — 10 25** ns

* These parameters are characterized but not tested.
** These parameters are design targets and are not tested. No characterization data available at this time.

† Data in the Typical (“Typ”) column is based on characterization results at 25C. This data is for design guid-
ance only and is not tested.

Note 1: Measurements are taken in RC Mode where CLKOUT output is 4 x TOSC.
2: Please refer to Figure 13.1 for load conditions.

OSC1

CLKOUT

I/O Pin
(input)

I/O Pin
(output)

Q4 Q1 Q2 Q3

10

14

17

20, 21

18

15

11

16

Old Value New Value

19
1213

Note: Please refer to Figure 13.1 for load conditions.
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PIC16C5X
FIGURE 14-15: WDT TIMER TIME-OUT 
PERIOD vs. VDD(1)

FIGURE 14-16: TRANSCONDUCTANCE 
(gm) OF HS OSCILLATOR 
vs. VDD 
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PIC16C5X
15.3 DC Characteristics: PIC16LV54A-02 (Commercial) 
PIC16LV54A-02I (Industrial)  

PIC16LV54A-02
PIC16LV54A-02I

(Commercial, Industrial)

Standard Operating Conditions (unless otherwise specified)
Operating Temperature 0C  TA  +70C for commercial

–20C  TA  +85C for industrial

Param
No.

Symbol Characteristic Min Typ† Max Units Conditions

D001
VDD

Supply Voltage
RC and XT modes 2.0 — 3.8 V

D002 VDR RAM Data Retention 
Voltage(1)

— 1.5* — V Device in SLEEP mode

D003 VPOR VDD Start Voltage to ensure 
Power-on Reset

— Vss — V See Section 5.1 for details on 
Power-on Reset

D004 SVDD VDD Rise Rate to ensure 
Power-on Reset

0.05* — — V/ms See Section 5.1 for details on 
Power-on Reset

D010 IDD Supply Current(2)

RC(3) and XT modes
LP mode, Commercial
LP mode, Industrial

—
—
—

0.5
11
14

—
27
35

mA
A
A

FOSC = 2.0 MHz, VDD = 3.0V 
FOSC = 32 kHz, VDD = 2.5V WDT disabled
FOSC = 32 kHz, VDD = 2.5V WDT disabled

D020 IPD Power-down Current(2,4)

Commercial
Commercial
Industrial
Industrial

—
—
—
—

2.5
0.25
3.5
0.3

12
4.0
14
5.0

A
A
A
A

VDD = 2.5V, WDT enabled
VDD = 2.5V, WDT disabled
VDD = 2.5V, WDT enabled
VDD = 2.5V, WDT disabled

* These parameters are characterized but not tested.

† Data in the Typical (“Typ”) column is based on characterization results at 25C. This data is for design guid-
ance only and is not tested.

Note 1: This is the limit to which VDD can be lowered in SLEEP mode without losing RAM data.
2: The supply current is mainly a function of the operating voltage and frequency. Other factors such as bus 

loading, oscillator type, bus rate, internal code execution pattern and temperature also have an impact on 
the current consumption.

a) The test conditions for all IDD measurements in active Operation mode are: OSC1 = external square
wave, from rail-to-rail; all I/O pins tristated, pulled to VSS, T0CKI = VDD, MCLR = VDD; WDT enabled/
disabled as specified. 

b) For standby current measurements, the conditions are the same, except that the device is in SLEEP
mode. The power-down current in SLEEP mode does not depend on the oscillator type. 

3: Does not include current through REXT. The current through the resistor can be estimated by the formula: 
IR = VDD/2REXT (mA) with REXT in k.

4: The oscillator start-up time can be as much as 8 seconds for XT and LP oscillator selection on wake-up from 
SLEEP mode or during initial power-up.
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PIC16C5X
FIGURE 16-4: TYPICAL RC OSCILLATOR FREQUENCY vs. VDD, CEXT = 300 PF, 25C 
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PIC16C5X
IDD Supply Current(2,3)

D010 PIC16LC5X —
—

—

0.5
11

14

2.4
27

35

mA
A

A

FOSC = 4.0 MHz, VDD = 5.5V, XT and 
RC modes
FOSC = 32 kHz, VDD = 2.5V, LP mode, 
Commercial
FOSC = 32 kHz, VDD = 2.5V, LP mode, 
Industrial

D010A PIC16C5X —
—
—
—

—

1.8
2.6
4.5
14

17

2.4
3.6*
16
32

40

mA
mA
mA
A

A

FOSC = 4 MHz, VDD = 5.5V, XT and RC 
modes
FOSC = 10 MHz, VDD = 3.0V, HS mode
FOSC = 20 MHz, VDD = 5.5V, HS mode
FOSC = 32 kHz, VDD = 3.0V, LP mode,
Commercial
FOSC = 32 kHz, VDD = 3.0V, LP mode,
Industrial

17.1  DC Characteristics:PIC16C54C/C55A/C56A/C57C/C58B-04, 20 (Commercial, Industrial) 
PIC16LC54C/LC55A/LC56A/LC57C/LC58B-04 (Commercial, Industrial) 
PIC16CR54C/CR56A/CR57C/CR58B-04, 20 (Commercial, Industrial)
PIC16LCR54C/LCR56A/LCR57C/LCR58B-04 (Commercial, Industrial)

PIC16LC5X
PIC16LCR5X

(Commercial, Industrial)

Standard Operating Conditions (unless otherwise specified)
Operating Temperature 0C  TA  +70C for commercial

–40C  TA  +85C for industrial

PIC16C5X
PIC16CR5X

(Commercial, Industrial)

Standard Operating Conditions (unless otherwise specified)
Operating Temperature 0C  TA  +70C for commercial

–40C  TA  +85C for industrial

Param
No.

Symbol Characteristic/Device Min Typ† Max Units Conditions

Legend: Rows with standard voltage device data only are shaded for improved readability.

* These parameters are characterized but not tested.

† Data in “Typ” column is at 5V, 25C, unless otherwise stated. These parameters are for design guidance only, and
are not tested.

Note 1: This is the limit to which VDD can be lowered in SLEEP mode without losing RAM data.
2: The supply current is mainly a function of the operating voltage and frequency. Other factors such as bus loading, 

oscillator type, bus rate, internal code execution pattern and temperature also have an impact on the current con-
sumption.
a) The test conditions for all IDD measurements in active Operation mode are: OSC1 = external square wave,

from rail-to-rail; all I/O pins tristated, pulled to VSS, T0CKI = VDD, MCLR = VDD; WDT enabled/disabled
as specified. 

b) For standby current measurements, the conditions are the same, except that the device is in SLEEP mode.
The power-down current in SLEEP mode does not depend on the oscillator type. 

3: Does not include current through REXT. The current through the resistor can be estimated by the formula: 
IR = VDD/2REXT (mA) with REXT in k.
 1997-2013 Microchip Technology Inc. Preliminary DS30453E-page 135



PIC16C5X
FIGURE 18-10: VTH (INPUT THRESHOLD TRIP POINT VOLTAGE) OF OSC1 INPUT  (IN XT, HS 
AND LP MODES) vs. VDD

FIGURE 18-11: TYPICAL IDD vs. FREQUENCY (WDT DISABLED, RC MODE @ 20 PF, 25C)
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PIC16C5X
FIGURE 19-6: TIMER0 CLOCK TIMINGS - PIC16C5X-40

TABLE 19-4: TIMER0 CLOCK REQUIREMENTS PIC16C5X-40  

AC Characteristics
Standard Operating Conditions (unless otherwise specified)
Operating Temperature 0°C  TA  +70°C for commercial

Param 
No.

Symbol Characteristic Min Typ† Max Units Conditions

40 Tt0H T0CKI High Pulse Width
- No Prescaler 0.5 TCY + 20* — — ns

- With Prescaler 10* — — ns

41 Tt0L T0CKI Low Pulse Width
- No Prescaler 0.5 TCY + 20* — — ns

- With Prescaler 10* — — ns

42 Tt0P T0CKI Period 20 or TCY + 40*
          N

— — ns Whichever is greater.
N = Prescale Value

(1, 2, 4,..., 256)

* These parameters are characterized but not tested.

† Data in the Typical (“Typ”) column is at 5V, 25°C unless otherwise stated. These parameters are for design
guidance only and are not tested.

T0CKI

40 41

42
Note: Refer to Figure 19-2 for load conditions.
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PIC16C5X
FIGURE 20-9: IOL vs. VOL, VDD = 5 V
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PIC16C5X
28-Lead Plastic Shrink Small Outline (SS) – 209 mil, 5.30 mm (SSOP)

* Controlling Parameter

Notes:
Dimensions D and E1 do not include mold flash or protrusions. Mold flash or protrusions shall not exceed 
.010” (0.254mm) per side.
JEDEC Equivalent:  MS-150
Drawing No. C04-073

10501050Mold Draft Angle Bottom

10501050Mold Draft Angle Top

0.380.320.25.015.013.010BLead Width

203.20101.600.00840Foot Angle

0.250.180.10.010.007.004cLead Thickness

0.940.750.56.037.030.022LFoot Length

10.3410.2010.06.407.402.396DOverall Length

5.385.255.11.212.207.201E1Molded Package Width

8.107.857.59.319.309.299EOverall Width

0.250.150.05.010.006.002A1Standoff §

1.831.731.63.072.068.064A2Molded Package Thickness

1.981.851.73.078.073.068AOverall Height

0.65.026pPitch

2828nNumber of Pins

MAXNOMMINMAXNOMMINDimension Limits

MILLIMETERS*INCHESUnits

2
1

D

p

n

B

E1

E

L

c





A2

A1

A



§ Significant Characteristic

Note: For the most current package drawings, please see the Microchip Packaging Specification located
at http://www.microchip.com/packaging
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